
BID TABULATION FORM

UNIFORM APPAREL FOR FIRE DEPARTMENT - RFB #PUR0517-242

JUNE 28, 2017 @ 3:00 PM

 Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.

Danville, IL 

 Kieck's

Cedar Rapids, IA 

 Firm Fixed Price  Firm Fixed Price 

SHIRTS - price includes attachment of two (2) emblems supplies by the Fire Department

Mfg/Style  Liberty  Liberty 722 

Regular Sizes  $                             24.00  $                               24.42 

Extended Sizes  $                             24.00  $                               25.83 

Mfg/Style  Liberty  Liberty 7232 

Regular Sizes  $                             22.00  $                               20.27 

Extended Sizes  $                             22.00  $                               21.85 

Mfg/Style  Liberty  Liberty 722 

Regular Sizes  $                             23.00  $                               24.42 

Extended Sizes  $                             23.00  $                               25.83 

Mfg/Style  Liberty  Liberty 732 

Regular Sizes  $                             20.00  $                               20.27 

Extended Sizes  $                             20.00  $                               21.85 

Mfg/Style 5.11  5.11 72314 

Regular Sizes  $                             50.50  $                               58.00 

Extended Sizes  $                             58.50  $                               73.00 

PANTS

Mfg/Style  Dickies  Dickie 874 

Regular Sizes  $                             19.00  $                               23.64 

Extended Sizes  $                             23.50  $                               23.64 

Mfg/Style  Fechheimer  Fechheimer 38200 

Regular Sizes  $                             36.00  $                               44.00 

Extended Sizes  $                               46.20 

Mfg/Style  Propper  Tru Spec 1125, 1061 

Regular Sizes  $                             36.00  $                               39.97 

Extended Sizes  $                               45.97 

Mfg/Style  Propper  Tru Spec 1125, 1095 

Regular Sizes  $                             36.00  $                               39.97 

Extended Sizes  $                               45.97 

SHORTS

Mfg/Style  Tru Spec 

Regular Sizes  $                             40.00  $                               47.50 

Extended Sizes

Mfg/Style  Tru Spec 

Regular Sizes  $                             40.00  $                               47.50 

Extended Sizes

Women's, Navy Blue, TruSpec Ascent style #1119 or equal

1/4 Zip Job Shirt, Navy Blue, 80/20 cotton/poly fleece (11.6oz), 

511 Tactical #72314 or equal

Straight Leg, Navy Blue, Dickie style #874 or equal

Uniform Pant, Navy Blue, Fechheimer class 'A' #38200 or equal

EMT Pant, men's, Navy Blue, Propper #F5221-14-412, Tru Spec 

24x7 #1125, #1061, or equal

EMT Pant, women's, Navy Blue, Propper #F528614, Tru Spec 

24x7 #1125, #1095, or equal

Men's, Navy Blue, TruSpec Ascent style #1119 or equal

SUPPLIERS:

Description

Long Sleeved, Light Blue, 65/35 poly/cotton (5-1/4oz), Liberty 

#722 MLB or equal

Short Sleeved, Light Blue, 65/35 poly/cotton (5-1/4oz), Liberty 

#732 MLB or equal

Long Sleeved, White, 65/35 poly/cotton (5-1/4oz), Liberty #722 

MWH or equal

Short Sleeved, White, 65/35 poly/cotton (5-1/4oz), Liberty #732 

MWH or equal



BID TABULATION FORM

UNIFORM APPAREL FOR FIRE DEPARTMENT - RFB #PUR0517-242

JUNE 28, 2017 @ 3:00 PM

 Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.

Danville, IL 

 Kieck's

Cedar Rapids, IA 

 Firm Fixed Price  Firm Fixed Price 

SUPPLIERS:

Description

JACKETS - pricing includes attachment of four (4) emblems supplied by the Fire Department

Mfg/Style  Spiewak  Spiewak S3616/S327 

Regular Sizes  $109 + $88 = $197  $                             222.00 

Extended Sizes  $109 + $88 = $197  $                             234.00 

DRESS COAT

Mfg/Style  Fechheimer  Fechheimer 38804 

Regular Sizes  $                           120.00  $                             150.00 

Extended Sizes  $                             167.00 

BELT

Mfg/Style  Boston Leather  Boston Leather 

Regular Sizes  $                             52.00  $                               18.25 

Extended Sizes  $                               19.00 

SHOES

Mfg/Style  Bates  Bates 941 

Price per pair  $                             96.00  $                               98.00 

Mfg/Style  Bates  Bates 2261 

Price per pair  $                             77.50  $                               95.00 

Mfg/Style  Bates  Bates 2262 

Price per pair  $                             70.00  $                               83.25 

Mfg/Style  Bates  Bates 2263 

Price per pair  $                             90.00  $                             106.00 

Mfg/Style  Rocky  Rocky 2173 

Price per pair  $                             84.00  $                               91.00 

Mfg/Style  sub Thorogood 834-6520 

Price per pair  no bid  $                               59.00 

Mfg/Style  Rocky  Rocky 5000 

Price per pair  $                           104.00  $                             107.00 

Mfg/Style  Rocky  Rocky 5001 

Price per pair  $                           108.00  $                             110.00 

Mfg/Style  Thorogood  Thorogood 834-6041 

Price per pair  $                             53.00  $                               59.00 

Mfg/Style

Price per pair  no bid  discontinued 

Mfg/Style  Thorogood  Thorogood 834-6218 

Price per pair  $                             80.00  $                               90.00 

Thorogood #834-6041 Uniform Leather Oxford

Thorogood #834-6180 Athletic Oxford     discontinued

Thorogood #834-6218 6" Waterproof Side-Zip Boot

Bates Low Cut Boot #2262 Tactical Sport

Bates #2263 8" Tactical Composite Toe Zip

Rocky #2173 Alpha Force 8" Zip Waterproof Boot

Rocky #911-104-2 SlipStop Slip-on     discontinued

Rocky #5000 TMC Plain Toe Oxford

Rocky #5001 TMC Athletic Oxford

Spiewak S3616/S327 (29") or equal

Hardwick Regent (2 B Blazer) or Chief's Men's style #38804 or 

equal; Captain Pair of Yellow Stripes, Gold Buttons

Belt - Black, Top Leather Grain, Boston brand or equal

Bates High Gloss Uniform Oxford, HG #941

Bates #2261 Tactical Sport Side Zip 8"



BID TABULATION FORM

UNIFORM APPAREL FOR FIRE DEPARTMENT - RFB #PUR0517-242

JUNE 28, 2017 @ 3:00 PM

 Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.

Danville, IL 

 Kieck's

Cedar Rapids, IA 

 Firm Fixed Price  Firm Fixed Price 

SUPPLIERS:

Description

Mfg/Style  Thorogood  Thorogood 834-6219 

Price per pair  $                             83.00  $                               95.00 

Mfg/Style  Bates Code 6 (no zip) 

Price per pair  no bid  $                               76.00 

Mfg/Style  Bates 6688 

Price per pair  no bid  $                               85.00 

Mfg/Style  TR9982WP 

Price per pair  no bid  $                             112.00 

Mfg/Style  sub Thorogood 834-6034 

Price per pair  no bid  $                               89.00 

Mfg/Style  Merrell J06049 

Price per pair  no bid  $                             100.00 

OTHER

Mfg/Style  Midway Cap Company  Keystone R-8 

Price per pair  $                             37.00  $                               52.00 

Mfg/Style  Due North 

Price per pair  no bid  $                               26.25 

Mfg/Style  Samuel Broome  Samuel Broome 

Clip-on  $                               7.00  $                                 6.00 

Zip-up  no bid  $                                 6.00 

Tie  $                               7.00  $                                 6.00 

Certified Local Business?  No  Yes 

Estimated lead time:  Depends on quantity  10 calendar days 

Signature Page

Comments / Exceptions:  None  None 

Accept MasterCard?  Yes  Yes 

Quick pay discount:  None  None 

Tactical Research 8" Waterproof Side-zip Boot (TR998Z WP)

Danner Station Office Boot, 6" black     discontinued

Merrell Moab Ventilator     discontinued

Hat - Class "A" Uniform Dress Hat; Keystone R-8 or equal; Navy 

(Firefighters), White (Chiefs)

Traction Aids, price per pair, Due North All Purpose or equal

Tie - Black, 20", polyester, clip-on, zip-up, or tie options

Thorogood #834-6219 8" Zip Waterproof Boot

Code 6, 6" Side-zip Boot     not available w/ zipper

Code 6, 8" Side-zip Boot


